

EXHIBIT 2

Charles T. Berry, Esquire

Federal MEREDITH - YTD 2013 & 2014 - thru 08-18-2014

Printed 09/03/2014

Client Name	CODE	Date	Description	Hours	Rate	Period to Date	Period to Date	Period to Date
						FEES	EXPENSES	TOTAL
Meredith	OC-e	05/13/13	Calls from and to PD office RE: new case - perform conflict check	0.30	37.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-b	05/13/13	Begin retrieving and reviewing court documents	2.50	312.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-a	05/14/13	Calls from and to Meredith	1.50	187.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-c	05/14/13	Retrieve & review relevant US Code Sections	0.50	62.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-c	05/14/13	Research Sentencing Guidelines	0.90	112.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	05/14/13	Correspondence with MJ Kaul's office RE: scheduling arraignment	0.20	25.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	05/14/13	Copy documents and prepare for arraignment	0.40	50.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-d	05/15/13	Travel to and from Clarksburg for arraignment and initial meeting with Meredith	1.00	125.00	125.00		
Meredith	IC-a	05/15/13	Meet with Meredith prior to arraignment	1.50	187.50	125.00		
Meredith	IC-a	05/15/13	Arraignment	0.40	50.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-a	05/15/13	Meet with Shawn Morgan RE: discovery	0.20	25.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-a	05/15/13	Meet with Meredith and with Tom & Mary Dyer	1.10	137.50	125.00		
Meredith	IC-c	05/15/13	Attend motion hearing [Adkins] and scheduling conference	0.60	75.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-a	05/15/13	Meet with Meredith and arrange to get her copies of discovery disks	0.20	25.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-b	05/15/13	Begin review of discovery & copy discovery disks for Meredith	3.40	425.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-a	05/16/13	Calls for Meredith RE: delivery of discovery disks	0.20	25.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-d	05/16/13	Travel to and from Gaston Avenue to deliver disks to Meredith	0.60	75.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-a	05/16/13	Meet with Meredith to deliver discovery disks & court documents and to discuss discovery review	0.50	62.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	05/16/13	Copy documents for Meredith	0.50	62.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-b	05/16/13	Review and calendar scheduling order	0.30	37.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	05/16/13	Correspondence with Tom/Mary Dyer	0.10	12.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	05/20/13	Draft Joint Defense Agreement & forward to attorney Dyer for review	0.90	112.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-b	05/21/13	Review documents from Tom Dyer and continue discovery review	4.50	562.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-b	05/22/13	Continue discovery review	4.30	537.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	05/23/13	Correspondence with and call to Shawn Morgan RE: issues opening certain discovery disks	0.20	25.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-d	05/23/13	Travel to and from Clarksburg to meet with Shawn RE: discovery issues	1.00	125.00	125.00		

Charles T. Berry, Esquire

Federal MEREDITH - YTD 2013 & 2014 - thru 08-18-2014

Printed 09/03/2014

Client Name	CODE	Date	Description	Hours	Rate	Period to Date	Period to Date	Period to Date
						FEES	EXPENSES	TOTAL
Meredith	OC-a	05/23/13	Check in at Federal Center and meet with Shawn Morgan RE: discovery issues	0.90	112.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	05/23/13	Copy discovery received from Tom Dyer & forward to Meredith	0.40	50.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-b	05/23/13	Review discovery documents retrieved from Shawn Morgan	0.60	75.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	05/23/13	Draft letter to Meredith	0.50	62.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-a	05/24/13	Numerous calls from Meredith	1.70	212.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-b	05/24/13	Begin review of latest discovery disks received from Shawn	5.60	700.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	05/24/13	Scan select discovery documents and forward to Meredith	0.30	37.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-b	05/28/13	Continue discovery review	2.80	350.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-a	05/28/13	Call from and to Meredith RE: meeting	0.20	25.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	05/28/13	Numerous correspondence with Shawn Morgan RE: discovery issues	0.30	37.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-c	05/28/13	Preliminary research RE: SORNA & WV registration laws	1.40	175.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	05/28/13	Copy discovery disks and mail to Meredith	1.00	125.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	05/28/13	Copy documents and prepare for meeting with Meredith	1.00	125.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-d	05/29/13	Travel to and from Clarksburg to meet with Meredith	1.00	125.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-a	05/29/13	Meet with Meredith to discuss discovery, strategy and potential plea	4.70	587.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-b	05/29/13	Continue review of voluminous discovery	3.40	425.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	05/29/13	Correspondence with Meredith	0.30	37.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-b	05/29/13	Correspondence with Shawn RE: even more discovery	0.20	25.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-b	05/29/13	Correspondence with David Frame RE: investigative materials	0.20	25.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-b	05/29/13	Review documents received from Frame	0.20	25.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-a	05/30/13	Calls from Meredith	0.70	87.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-a	05/31/13	Multiple calls from Meredith RE: tapes of conversations with Adkins	1.50	187.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-b	05/31/13	Review tape of conversation b/t Meredith & Adkins	0.40	50.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-b	05/31/13	Review pro se motion [correspondence] and order scheduling hearing	0.50	62.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	05/31/13	Correspondence with Shawn RE: meeting	0.10	12.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-b	05/31/13	Research ND Indiana CMECF RE: Adkins revocation case - download & print selected documents	1.00	125.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	05/31/13	Forward court filings to Meredith	0.10	12.50	125.00		

Charles T. Berry, Esquire

Federal MEREDITH - YTD 2013 & 2014 - thru 08-18-2014

Printed 09/03/2014

Client Name	CODE	Date	Description	Hours	Rate	Period to Date	Period to Date	Period to Date
						FEES	EXPENSES	TOTAL
Meredith	OC-b	05/31/13	Continue discovery review	1.80	225.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	06/03/13	Multiple correspondence with Meredith RE: documents for meeting with Shawn	0.50	62.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	06/03/13	Correspondence from Shawn RE: supplemental discovery	0.10	12.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-b	06/03/13	Review multiple documents created by Meredith for the meeting with Shawn	1.00	125.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	06/03/13	Prepare for meeting with Shawn Morgan RE: proffer	2.00	250.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-d	06/03/13	Travel to and from Clarksburg for meeting with Shawn	1.00	125.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-a	06/03/13	Meet with Shawn RE: proffer of Meredith	1.00	125.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-a	06/04/13	Call to Dyer RE: motion and budget	0.60	75.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-c	06/04/13	Review scheduling order & draft motion to amend	0.70	87.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-c	06/04/13	Convert document to PDF and file using CM/ECF	0.20	25.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	06/04/13	Correspondence with Candace RE: hearing schedule	0.10	12.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-b	06/04/13	Continue review of discovery	3.80	475.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	06/05/13	Copy latest discovery disk and mail to Meredith	0.40	50.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-a	06/05/13	Return call to Meredith	1.70	212.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-d	06/05/13	Travel to and from Clarksburg for hearing	1.00	125.00	125.00		
Meredith	IC-c	06/05/13	Attend hearing	2.30	287.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-a	06/05/13	Meet with Shawn & John Hare RE proffer; meet with Tom Dyer	0.40	50.00	125.00		
Fees 5/13/13 thru 6/5/13						9,675.00		
Meredith	OE	05/14/13	Photocopy charges		6.50			
Meredith	TE	05/15/13	Travel expenses - mileage		28.25			
Meredith	TE	05/15/13	Travel expenses - parking		1.00			
Meredith	TE	05/15/13	Travel expenses - meals - lunch		15.97			
Meredith	TE	05/16/13	Travel expenses - mileage		10.17			
Meredith	OE	05/16/13	Photocopy charges		6.75			
Meredith	OE	05/22/13	Photocopy charges		11.75			
Meredith	OE	05/23/13	Photocopy charges		24.50			
Meredith	OE	05/23/13	Postage		6.15			
Meredith	OE	05/28/13	Postage		1.42			
Meredith	OE	05/28/13	Photocopy charges		20.50			
Meredith	TE	05/29/13	Travel expenses - mileage		28.25			
Meredith	TE	05/29/13	Travel expenses - parking		2.00			

Charles T. Berry, Esquire

Federal MEREDITH - YTD 2013 & 2014 - thru 08-18-2014

Printed 09/03/2014

Client Name	CODE	Date	Description	Hours	Rate	Period to Date	Period to Date	Period to Date
						FEES	EXPENSES	TOTAL
Meredith	TE	05/29/13	Travel expenses - meals - lunch		7.61			
Meredith	TE	06/03/13	Travel expenses - mileage		28.25			
Meredith	OE	06/05/13	Postage		1.38			
Meredith	TE	06/05/13	Travel expenses - mileage		28.25			
Meredith	TE	06/05/13	Travel expenses - parking		1.00			
Meredith	TE	06/05/13	Travel expenses - meals - lunch		12.00			
Expenses 5/13/13 Thru 6/5/13						241.70		
Total Fees & Expenses 5/13/13 thru 6/5/13								9,916.70
Meredith	OC-b	06/06/13	Review recent Court filings and forward to Meredith	0.40	50.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-a	06/07/13	Call from Meredith	0.60	75.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-b	06/10/13	Review numerous recordings provided by Meredith	2.40	300.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-b	06/11/13	Review numerous audio tapes provided by Meredith - reciprocal discovery	2.30	287.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-a	06/11/13	Call from Meredith RE: tapes and her concerns RE litigation	2.10	262.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-b	06/12/13	Review timeline and other documents sent from Meredith	1.10	137.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-c	06/12/13	Modify timeline for submission to Shawn	0.40	50.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-d	06/12/13	Travel to and from NCRJ to meet with Adkins	2.00	250.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-a	06/12/13	Meet with Adkins RE: his request	1.20	150.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-a	06/13/13	Calls from Meredith	1.20	150.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-b	06/13/13	Review numerous filings by Adkins - forward to Meredith	0.40	50.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	06/14/13	Continue to review and modify documents to forward to Shawn Morgan	0.80	100.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	06/14/13	Download numerous documents to disk to send to Shawn	0.50	62.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-b	06/14/13	Review numerous additional documents and tapes from Meredith to send to Shawn	1.80	225.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	06/14/13	Download additional documents to send to Shawn	0.30	37.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	06/14/13	Draft letter to Shawn RE: proffer	0.40	50.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-c	06/17/13	Research Duress defense	4.30	537.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-a	06/17/13	Calls to and from Richard Walker RE: duress defense	0.30	37.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	06/17/13	Correspondence with numerous CJA panel attorneys RE duress defense	0.40	50.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-a	06/17/13	Return call to Meredith	1.10	137.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-b	06/17/13	Review numerous documents from Meredith	0.80	100.00	125.00		

Charles T. Berry, Esquire

Federal MEREDITH - YTD 2013 & 2014 - thru 08-18-2014

Printed 09/03/2014

Client Name	CODE	Date	Description	Hours	Rate	Period to Date	Period to Date	Period to Date
						FEES	EXPENSES	TOTAL
Meredith	OC-b	06/18/13	Retrieve and review documents from Wheeling case where duress defense was used	0.50	62.50 ✓ 125.00			
Meredith	OC-a	06/18/13	Call for and from Dr. William Fremouw RE: evaluation of Meredith	0.30	37.50 ✓ 125.00			
Meredith	OC-b	06/18/13	Review numerous documents & recordings from Meredith to determine what to submit in reciprocal discovery	2.30	287.50 ✓ 125.00			
Meredith	OC-a	06/18/13	Call to Meredith RE: discovery disclosures	0.60	75.00 ✓ 125.00			
Meredith	OC-b	06/18/13	Download documents and recordings for discovery disclosure [2 disks]	0.70	87.50 ✓ 125.00			
Meredith	OC-e	06/18/13	Draft letter to Shawn Morgan/Adkins RE discovery	0.30	37.50 ✓ 125.00			
Meredith	OC-b	06/19/13	Review recently filed court documents & calendar hearing	0.30	37.50 ✓ 125.00			
Meredith	OC-e	06/19/13	Correspondence with Meredith including recently filed documents	0.10	12.50 ✓ 125.00			
Meredith	OC-e	06/19/13	Correspondence with Steve Herndon RE: duress defense	0.10	12.50 ✓ 125.00			
Meredith	OC-c	06/19/13	Research RE pretrial motions	1.40	175.00 ✓ 125.00			
Meredith	OC-a	06/19/13	Return call to Meredith	1.10	137.50 ✓ 125.00			
Meredith	OC-c	06/19/13	Draft initial pretrial motions	1.60	200.00 ✓ 125.00			
Meredith	OC-e	06/20/13	Review and file initial pretrial motions	0.30	37.50 ✓ 125.00			
Meredith	OC-e	06/20/13	Copy & mail motions to Adkins	0.30	37.50 ✓ 125.00			
Meredith	OC-e	06/20/13	Review letter from Adkins & forward to Loretta	0.20	25.00 ✓ 125.00			
Meredith	OC-e	06/21/13	Numerous correspondence from Meredith	0.30	37.50 ✓ 125.00			
Meredith	OC-b	06/21/13	Review additional trants from Adkins - filed with court & forwarded to Meredith	0.20	25.00 ✓ 125.00			
Meredith	OC-d	06/24/13	Travel to and from Clarksburg for hearing	1.00	125.00 ✓ 125.00			
Meredith	IC-c	06/24/13	Attend hearing RE Adkins' motions - hearing delayed 1 hour	1.50	187.50 ✓ 125.00			
Meredith	OC-a	06/24/13	Discuss potential proffer with Shawn Morgan	0.20	25.00 ✓ 125.00			
Meredith	OC-e	06/24/13	Correspondence with and call from Meredith RE: new trial schedule	0.70	87.50 ✓ 125.00			
Fees 6/5/13 thru 6/24/13						67.80		
Meredith	TE	06/12/13	Travel expenses - mileage		6.56			
Meredith	TE	06/12/13	Travel expenses - meals - lunch		1.12			
Meredith	OE	06/14/13	Postage		0.75			
Meredith	OE	06/18/13	Photocopy charges		2.24			
Meredith	OE	06/18/13	Postage		1.25			
Meredith	OE	06/20/13	Photocopy charges					
						4,850.00		

Charles T. Berry, Esquire

Federal MEREDITH - YTD 2013 & 2014 - thru 08-18-2014

Printed 09/03/2014

Client Name	CODE	Date	Description	Hours	Rate	Period to Date	Period to Date	Period to Date
						FEES	EXPENSES	TOTAL
Meredith	OE	06/20/13	Postage		0.66			
Meredith	TE	06/24/13	Travel expenses - mileage		28.25			
Meredith	TE	06/24/13	Travel expenses - Parking		0.50			
Expenses 6/5/13 thru 6/24/13								
Total Fees & Expenses 6/5/13 thru 6/24/13							109.13	4,959.13
Meredith	OC-b	06/27/13	Review additional discovery from Shawn Morgan	1.00	125.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	06/27/13	Correspondence from and to Meredith	0.30	37.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-a	06/28/13	Calls to and from Mary Loss RE: hearing set for 7/2/13	0.30	37.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-b	06/28/13	Review order & forward to Meredith with comments	0.20	25.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	07/02/13	Review letter from Adkins - forward to Meredith	0.20	25.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	07/02/13	Draft letter to Adkins	0.50	62.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-b	07/02/13	Review government's response to pretrial motions	0.30	37.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	07/02/13	Correspondence with Meredith RE response and anticipated superseding indictment	0.10	12.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-a	07/02/13	Call from Meredith	0.40	50.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	07/02/13	Correspondence with Meredith	0.20	25.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	07/03/13	Correspondence with Meredith RE psychologist contact information	0.40	50.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-a	07/08/13	Call from Adkins	0.30	37.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-b	07/08/13	Review orders	0.40	50.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	07/08/13	Correspondence with Meredith RE call from Adkins and recent court filings	0.40	50.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	07/09/13	Numerous correspondence with Meredith RE: Adkins and psych evaluation details	0.50	62.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-b	07/10/13	Review and compare 3rd superseding indictment	0.40	50.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	07/10/13	Correspondence with Meredith RE superseding indictment & psych evaluation	0.30	37.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-a	07/10/13	Call from Meredith	0.40	50.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	07/11/13	Correspondence with Meredith - initiated by Meredith	0.30	37.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	07/11/13	Correspondence with Meredith	0.20	25.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-a	07/13/13	Call from Fremouw RE: testing & payment - correspondence with Meredith	0.40	50.00	125.00		

Charles T. Berry, Esquire

Federal MEREDITH - YTD 2013 & 2014 - thru 08-18-2014

Printed 09/03/2014

Client Name	CODE	Date	Description	Hours	Rate	Period to Date	Period to Date	Period to Date
						FEES	EXPENSES	TOTAL
Meredith	OC-a	07/15/13	Meet with Meredith in Fairmont at her request to discuss psych exam	1.20	150.00			
Meredith	OC-a	07/19/13	Call from Fremouw RE: testing & payment	0.10	12.50			
Meredith	OC-e	07/23/13	Correspondence with Fremouw	0.20	25.00			
Meredith	OC-a	07/23/13	Call from and correspondence with Meredith	0.40	50.00			
Meredith	OC-e	07/24/13	Prepare for conference call with Judge Keeley	0.50	62.50			
Meredith	OC-a	07/24/13	Conference call with Judge Keeley	0.40	50.00			
Meredith	OC-a	07/24/13	Call to Meredith	0.60	75.00			
Meredith	OC-b	07/25/13	Review documents filed by Adkins - forward to Meredith	0.30	37.50			
Meredith	OC-e	07/26/13	Correspondence with Shawn RE: meeting with Meredith at Meredith's request	0.30	37.50			
Meredith	OC-c	07/26/13	Review sentencing statutes & guidelines to provide Meredith a sentence estimate at her request - correspondence with Meredith RE research results	0.70	87.50			
Meredith	OC-b	07/29/13	Review documents sent from Meredith	0.50	62.50			
Meredith	OC-e	07/29/13	Correspondence with Shawn RE: arranged meeting today with Meredith	0.10	12.50			
Meredith	OC-d	07/29/13	Travel to and from Clarksburg for arraignment	1.00	125.00			
Meredith	OC-a	07/29/13	Attend arraignment	0.60	75.00			
Meredith	OC-a	07/29/13	Attend meeting [Requested by Meredith]: Shawn Morgan, John Hare, Meredith, me	1.50	187.50			
Meredith	OC-a	07/29/13	Meet with Meredith RE: strategy for case having failed in Duress defense	0.50	62.50			
Meredith	OC-c	07/31/13	Draft motion to exceed	0.70	87.50			
Meredith	OC-e	07/31/13	Correspondence with Clerk Rita RE: filing under seal	0.10	12.50			
Meredith	OC-e	07/31/13	Convert document to PDF and file using CMECF	0.30	37.50			
Meredith	OE	07/02/13	Fees 6/24/13 thru 7/31/13					2,187.50
Meredith	OE	07/02/13	Photocopy charges		0.75			
Meredith	OE	07/02/13	Postage		0.46			
Meredith	OC-b	08/05/13	Review recent filing by Adkins	0.10	12.50			
Meredith	OC-e	08/05/13	Correspondence with Meredith	0.10	12.50			
Expenses 6/24/13 thru 7/31/13								1.21
Total Fees and Expenses 6/24/13 thru 7/31/13								2,188.71

Charles T. Berry, Esquire

Federal MEREDITH - YTD 2013 & 2014 - thru 08-18-2014

Printed 09/03/2014

Client Name	CODE	Date	Description	Hours	Rate	Period to Date	Period to Date	Period to Date
						FEES	EXPENSES	TOTAL
Meredith	OC-b	08/07/13	Review 4th superseding indictment and compare to 3rd superseding indictment	0.30	37.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	08/07/13	Numerous correspondence with Candace, Dyer and Shawn RE: scheduling the arraignment for 4th superseding indictment	0.70	87.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-a	08/07/13	Correspondence with and call from Meredith	0.50	62.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	08/08/13	Correspondence with Candace RE: waiver of appearance for arraignment & Dyer & Meredith	0.40	50.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-b	08/08/13	Review recently filed documents - forward to Meredith	0.20	25.00	125.00		
Fees 7/31/13 thru 8/8/13						287.50		
Expenses 7/31/13 thru 8/8/13							0.00	
Total Fees and Expenses 7/31/13 thru 8/8/13						287.50		287.50
Meredith	OC-b	08/09/13	Review recently filed documents - forward to Meredith	0.20	25.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-a	08/09/13	Correspondence with and calls from Meredith RE: waiver of appearance	0.60	75.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-a	08/12/13	Calls from Meredith RE proposed plea	1.10	137.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	08/12/13	Numerous correspondence with Meredith RE: waiver	0.30	37.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-b	08/13/13	Review proposed plea agreement - forward to Meredith	0.50	62.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	08/15/13	Print and review 4th indictment	0.30	37.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-d	08/15/13	Travel to and from Clarksburg for arraignment	1.00	125.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-a	08/15/13	Discuss case with Morgan and Dyer	0.40	50.00	125.00		
Meredith	IC-a	08/15/13	Attend arraignment	0.30	37.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-b	08/15/13	Retrieve & review Adkins' memorandum	0.20	25.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-b	08/17/13	Retrieve and review court filings	0.10	12.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	08/17/13	Correspondence with Meredith	0.20	25.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	08/19/13	Calls for Meredith	0.20	25.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-b	08/21/13	Review recent court filings	0.20	25.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	08/21/13	Correspondence with Meredith RE plea agreement & recent filings by Adkins	0.20	25.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-a	08/21/13	Discussions with Meredith RE: proposed plea agreement	1.80	225.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-a	08/22/13	Call to Dyer RE: plea agreement issues	0.20	25.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-b	08/22/13	Review plea agreement for Adkins	0.20	25.00	125.00		
Meredith	OC-a	08/22/13	Discuss/negotiate changes in plea agreement with Shawn Morgan	0.20	25.00	125.00		

Charles T. Berry, Esquire

Federal MEREDITH - YTD 2013 & 2014 - thru 08-18-2014

Printed 09/03/2014

Client Name	CODE	Date	Description	Hours	Rate	Period to Date	Period to Date	Period to Date
						FEES	EXPENSES	TOTAL
Meredith	OC-a	08/22/13	Call to Meredith RE discussion with Morgan and expected changes to plea agreement	0.70	87.50 ✓			125.00
Meredith	OC-b	08/29/13	Review recent filing by Adkins	0.10	12.50 ✓			125.00
Meredith	OC-b	09/03/13	Review recently filed documents	0.40	44.00 ✓			110.00
Meredith	OC-e	09/03/13	Review correspondence & documents from Meredith	0.50	55.00 ✓			110.00
Meredith	OC-e	09/03/13	Correspondence with Meredith	0.20	22.00 ✓			110.00
Meredith	OC-e	09/04/13	Correspondence with Shawn Morgan RE: plea agreement for Meredith & correspondence from and to Meredith	0.30	33.00 ✓			110.00
Meredith	OC-e	09/05/13	Correspondence with Shawn RE plea agreement	0.20	22.00 ✓			110.00
Meredith	OC-b	09/05/13	Review amended plea agreement and compare to first iteration of the plea	0.50	55.00 ✓			110.00
Meredith	OC-e	09/05/13	Correspondence with Meredith	0.20	22.00 ✓			110.00
Meredith	OC-e	09/06/13	Numerous correspondence with Shawn RE plea agreement V3	0.30	33.00 ✓			110.00
Meredith	OC-b	09/06/13	Review amended plea agreement and compare to second iteration of the plea	0.30	33.00 ✓			110.00
Meredith	OC-e	09/06/13	Correspondence with Meredith - plea agreement	0.40	44.00 ✓			110.00
Meredith	OC-a	09/06/13	Calls from Meredith RE: plea agreement	0.80	88.00 ✓			110.00
Meredith	OC-e	09/06/13	Correspondence with Shawn - forward signed plea agreement to Shawn	0.10	11.00 ✓			110.00
Meredith	OC-a	09/06/13	Calls to and from MJ Kaul's office to set plea hearing - calendar hearing	0.30	33.00 ✓			110.00
Meredith	OC-b	09/06/13	Review filing by Adkins	0.20	22.00 ✓			110.00
Meredith	OC-b	09/09/13	Review additional discovery from Shawn & Lisa Bishop; begin reviewing forensic report	1.00	110.00 ✓			110.00
Meredith	OC-b	09/11/13	Review documents filed today	0.10	11.00 ✓			110.00
Meredith	OC-b	09/19/13	Review court filings for last several days	0.40	44.00 ✓			110.00
Meredith	OC-b	09/19/13	Continue review of forensics report	1.10	121.00 ✓			110.00
Meredith	OC-b	09/19/13	Review additional discovery - grand jury transcript	0.40	44.00 ✓			110.00
Meredith	OC-a	09/20/13	Calls from and to Meredith RE: plea hearing	0.80	88.00 ✓			110.00
Meredith	OC-e	09/20/13	Attempt to copy forensic disk for Meredith	0.50	55.00 ✓			110.00
Meredith	OC-e	09/20/13	Correspondence with Meredith with requested documents	0.30	33.00 ✓			110.00
Meredith	OC-e	09/20/13	PDF fully signed plea agreement and forward to Meredith	0.20	22.00 ✓			110.00
Meredith	OC-e	09/20/13	Copy discovery documents and send to Meredith	0.70	77.00 ✓			110.00

Charles T. Berry, Esquire

Federal MEREDITH - YTD 2013 & 2014 - thru 08-18-2014

Printed 09/03/2014

Client Name	CODE	Date	Description	Hours	Rate	Period to Date	Period to Date	Period to Date
						FEES	EXPENSES	TOTAL
Mereditth	OC-b	09/20/13	Review additional discovery from Shawn Morgan	1.10	121.00	110.00		
Mereditth	OC-e	09/22/13	Correspondence with Shawn RE plea hearing issues	0.20	22.00	110.00		
Mereditth	OC-d	09/23/13	Travel to and from Clarksburg for plea hearing	1.00	110.00	110.00		
Mereditth	IC-a	09/23/13	Attend plea hearing	1.50	165.00	110.00		
Mereditth	OC-a	09/23/13	Meet with Meredith & John Burtas RE PSR interview	1.00	110.00	110.00		
Mereditth	OC-b	09/24/13	Retrieve and review recent court filings	0.30	33.00	110.00		
Mereditth	OC-e	09/24/13	Correspondence with Meredith - forward court documents	0.20	22.00	110.00		
Mereditth	OC-b	09/25/13	Retrieve, review and calendar recent court filings	0.40	44.00	110.00		
Mereditth	OC-b	09/26/13	Review documents filed today by Adkins	0.20	22.00	110.00		
Mereditth	OC-e	09/26/13	Forward recent filings to Meredith	0.10	11.00	110.00		
Mereditth	OC-a	09/26/13	Call from and to Meredith RE interview with John Burtas, PSR and sentencing	1.10	121.00	110.00		
Mereditth	OC-e	10/07/13	Correspondence with Meredith RE: DVO	0.20	22.00	110.00		
Mereditth	OC-c	10/07/13	Draft DVO for Meredith	0.80	88.00	110.00		
Mereditth	OC-e	10/08/13	Numerous correspondence with Meredith RE DVO	0.30	33.00	110.00		
Mereditth	OC-a	10/08/13	Calls from Meredith RE DVO modifications [modifications that she insists upon]	0.40	44.00	110.00		
Mereditth	OC-c	10/08/13	Review and amend DVO as per conversations with Meredith	0.20	22.00	110.00		
Mereditth	OC-e	10/08/13	Review recent court filing and forward to Meredith	0.20	22.00	110.00		
Mereditth	OC-e	10/09/13	PDF DVO and forward to Burtas - correspondence with Burtas	0.20	22.00	110.00		
Mereditth	OC-e	10/10/13	Correspondence with Meredith	0.20	22.00	110.00		
Mereditth	OC-a	10/18/13	Call from Meredith RE various issues	1.10	121.00	110.00		
Mereditth	OC-e	10/18/13	Correspondence with Meredith RE documents for PSR	0.30	33.00	110.00		
Mereditth	OC-a	10/21/13	Call from John Burtas RE: PSR material needed from Meredith	0.20	22.00	110.00		
Mereditth	OC-a	10/21/13	Correspondence with and call from Meredith RE documents that she needs to provide to John Burtas for the PSR	0.50	55.00	110.00		
Mereditth	OC-e	10/22/13	Correspondence with Meredith RE PSR docs	0.20	22.00	110.00		
Mereditth	OC-e	10/25/13	Review documents from Meredith RE PSR - correspondence with Meredith	0.40	44.00	110.00		
Mereditth	OC-e	10/28/13	Correspondence from and to Meredith	0.20	22.00	110.00		
Mereditth	OC-b	10/28/13	Review additional documents from Meredith	0.40	44.00	110.00		
Mereditth	OC-a	10/29/13	Calls from Meredith	0.60	66.00	110.00		
Mereditth	OC-b	10/30/13	Review two large packets of documents from Meredith	1.10	121.00	110.00		

38

Charles T. Berry, Esquire

Federal MEREDITH - YTD 2013 & 2014 - thru 08-18-2014

Printed 09/03/2014

Client Name	CODE	Date	Description	Hours	Rate	Period to Date	Period to Date	Period to Date
						FEES	EXPENSES	TOTAL
Meredith	OC-e	10/31/13	Multiple correspondence from Meredith	0.30	33.00			
Meredith	OC-e	11/01/13	Correspondence with probation RE PSR - correspondence with Meredith & forward PSR	0.30	33.00			
Meredith	OC-b	11/04/13	Review PSR	0.80	88.00			
Meredith	OC-e	11/04/13	Call for and correspondence with Meredith	0.20	22.00			
Meredith	OC-e	11/05/13	Call from and for Mary Dyer	0.20	22.00			
Meredith	OC-e	11/05/13	Correspondence from and to Meredith	0.20	22.00			
Meredith	OC-e	11/13/13	Call and correspondence from Meredith	0.40	44.00			
Meredith	OC-e	11/14/13	Review document from Meredith	0.20	22.00			
Meredith	OC-a	11/14/13	Two calls from Meredith RE PSR objections	1.20	132.00			
Meredith	OC-e	11/14/13	Retrieve documents from file and forward to Meredith	0.80	88.00			
Meredith	OC-a	11/18/13	Calls from and to Zack @ Dyer's office	0.30	33.00			
Meredith	OC-e	11/18/13	Retrieve documents for Dyer RE discovery review at NCRJ	0.40	44.00			
Meredith	OC-e	11/20/13	Review notes from Meredith RE objections to PSR	0.20	22.00			
Meredith	OC-c	11/20/13	Research & review numerous cases RE sentence enhancements suggested by John Burtas	5.20	572.00			
Meredith	OC-e	11/20/13	Correspondence with AUSA Morgan RE errors in plea agreement	0.20	22.00			
Meredith	OC-e	11/20/13	Correspondence with Meredith RE sentence enhancement research & PSR issues	0.50	55.00			
Meredith	OC-a	11/21/13	Calls to and from John Burtas RE PSR errors	0.20	22.00			
Meredith	OC-e	11/21/13	Draft listing of PSR errors and forward to John Burtas	0.40	44.00			
Meredith	OC-b	11/21/13	Retrieve & review recent court filings	0.10	11.00			
Meredith	OC-e	11/25/13	Correspondence with Burtas RE PSR issues	0.30	33.00			
Meredith	OC-e	11/25/13	Draft & amend objections to PSR	1.00	110.00			
Meredith	OC-e	11/25/13	Correspondence with Meredith RE PSR issues	0.40	44.00			
Meredith	OC-e	11/26/13	Numerous correspondence from Meredith	0.40	44.00			
Meredith	OC-e	11/27/13	Correspondence from Meredith & respond to the same	0.30	33.00			
Meredith	OC-e	12/02/13	Finalize PSR objections and forward to Burtas in PDF format	0.40	44.00			
Meredith	OC-b	12/02/13	Review motion filed by Morgan	0.10	11.00			
Meredith	OC-e	12/02/13	Correspondence with Meredith	0.20	22.00			
Meredith	OC-a	12/03/13	Calls from and to Burtas RE PSR issues	0.20	22.00			
Meredith	OC-a	12/03/13	Second call from Burtas RE PSR issue	0.30	33.00			
Meredith	OC-e	12/03/13	Correspondence with Meredith RE forfeiture motion etc.	0.30	33.00			
								1,287

Charles T. Berry, Esquire

Federal MEREDITH - YTD 2013 & 2014 - thru 08-18-2014

Printed 09/03/2014

Client Name	CODE	Date	Description	Hours	Rate	Period to Date	Period to Date	Period to Date
						FEES	EXPENSES	TOTAL
Meredith	OC-e	12/04/13	Correspondence with Morgan & Hare RE return of Meredith's property	0.20	22.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-b	12/04/13	Review recent court filings and forward to Meredith	0.20	22.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	12/06/13	Review and respond to correspondence from Hare & Meredith	0.30	33.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-b	12/06/13	Retrieve & review court filing	0.10	11.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-a	12/09/13	Calls from and to Meredith	0.70	77.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	12/10/13	Numerous correspondence with probation and Meredith RE: final PSR with objections; review objections by government and changes by probation	0.70	77.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-a	12/12/13	Call from John Forrest RE character letter	0.20	22.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	12/12/13	Review 2 character letters	0.20	22.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-b	12/16/13	Review recent court filing	0.10	11.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-b	12/16/13	Review character letters & numerous correspond with Meredith	0.70	77.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	12/17/13	Review character letters and other documents from Meredith	0.60	66.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-a	12/17/13	Call from Meredith	0.90	99.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	12/18/13	Correspondence with Meredith - review documents from Meredith	0.40	44.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	12/19/13	Draft letter to Catholic Charities - fax the same	0.40	44.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	12/20/13	Correspondence with and call from Meredith RE character letters	0.30	33.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	12/20/13	Review numerous court filings	0.20	22.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-b	12/23/13	Review recent court filing - forward to Meredith	0.20	22.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	12/26/13	Numerous correspondence with Meredith	0.40	44.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	12/26/13	Review, organize and PDF numerous character letters	1.30	143.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-b	12/26/13	Review recent court filings - forward to Meredith	0.10	11.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	12/27/13	Numerous correspondence with Meredith & others RE character letters - review additional letters	1.10	121.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-c	12/30/13	Formulate timeline and draft sentencing memorandum	4.20	462.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-a	12/30/13	Call from and argue with Meredith over content of sentencing memo	0.50	55.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	12/30/13	Correspondence with Shawn & Meredith RE debriefing	0.20	22.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	12/30/13	Cull through character letters and chose best ones for inclusion with memorandum	0.80	88.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	12/30/13	Review and PDF additional character letters	0.70	77.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	12/30/13	Arrange to file under seal	0.10	11.00	110.00		

Charles T. Berry, Esquire

Federal MEREDITH - YTD 2013 & 2014 - thru 08-18-2014

Printed 09/03/2014

Client Name	CODE	Date	Description	Hours	Rate	Period to Date	Period to Date	Period to Date
						FEES	EXPENSES	TOTAL
Meredith	OC-c	12/30/13	Convert documents to PDF & file memo & 30 attachments	0.50	55.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	12/30/13	Correspondence with Shawn RE sentencing memo	0.10	11.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	01/02/14	Review letters from Elaine	0.20	22.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	01/02/14	Forward sentencing memo and 30 attachments to AUSA Morgan & John Burtas - had to send in 4 sets after first attempt was too large for recipients	0.80	88.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-a	01/06/14	Call from Meredith RE: rescheduling hearing & debriefing	0.70	77.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	01/06/14	Correspondence with and call to Shawn Morgan RE rescheduling hearing	0.20	22.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-c	01/06/14	Draft motion to continue and certificate of service	0.70	77.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	01/06/14	File documents using ECF	0.20	22.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	01/06/14	Correspondence with and call to Melody RE: using elevator for Meredith	0.20	22.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	01/06/14	Correspondence with Shawn RE abandonment form - review form	0.10	11.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	01/06/14	PDF form and send to Meredith	0.20	22.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	01/06/14	Sign form returned by Meredith, PDF and forward to Shawn	0.20	22.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-a	01/07/14	Call to Meredith RE allocation & sentencing arguments	0.80	88.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-a	01/07/14	Call to Emily RE: motion to continue	0.10	11.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	01/07/14	Review order and forward to Meredith	0.10	11.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-a	01/07/14	Call from Meredith RE continuance	0.30	33.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	01/10/14	Call for & correspondence to Shawn Morgan	0.20	22.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-a	01/10/14	Call to Emily and Carol RE rescheduling sentencing hearing	0.20	22.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-a	01/10/14	Call to Meredith	0.20	22.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	01/10/14	Correspondence with John Burtas	0.10	11.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-b	01/23/14	Review recent court filings	0.10	11.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	01/27/14	Arrange with John Hare to retrieve Meredith's personal property	0.10	11.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-a	01/28/14	Meet with John Hare to retrieve Meredith's personal property	0.30	33.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	01/31/14	Correspondence with Meredith	0.20	22.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-b	01/31/14	Revview recent court filings	0.10	11.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	02/03/14	Correspondence from Meredith	0.10	11.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	02/05/14	Mail personal items to Meredith	0.20	22.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	02/05/14	Correspondence with Shawn RE abandonment letter	0.20	22.00	110.00		
						572		

Charles T. Berry, Esquire

Federal MEREDITH - YTD 2013 & 2014 - thru 08-18-2014

Printed 09/03/2014

Client Name	CODE	Date	Description	Hours	Rate	Period to Date	Period to Date	Period to Date
						FEES	EXPENSES	TOTAL
Meredith	OC-e	02/05/14	Retrieve PDF of abandonment letter from archives and forward to Shawn	0.20	22.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-b	02/06/14	Review filing	0.10	11.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	02/06/14	Correspondence from Meredith	0.10	11.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	02/07/14	Correspondence with Meredith RE sentencing issues	0.20	22.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-b	02/12/14	Review court filing	0.10	11.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-a	02/13/14	Call from Meredith RE testifying at Adkins' trial	0.30	33.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-b	02/14/14	Review recent filings - forward to Meredith	0.30	33.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	02/14/14	Correspondence with Shawn & Meredith RE Adkins' trial date	0.30	33.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-b	02/21/14	Retrieve & review recent filings	0.10	11.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	02/25/14	Call to and correspondence with Carole RE scheduling Meredith's sentencing	0.30	33.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	02/25/14	Correspondence with Shawn RE scheduling issues	0.10	11.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	02/25/14	Review recent court filings	0.20	22.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	02/25/14	Correspondence with Meredith RE sentencing issues	0.20	22.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-a	02/26/14	Call to and correspondence with Carole RE scheduling Meredith's sentencing	0.30	33.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-e	02/26/14	Correspondence with Shawn RE scheduling	0.10	11.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-a	02/26/14	Call to Meredith RE sentencing	0.50	55.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-b	02/27/14	Review recent filings - forward to Meredith	0.20	22.00	110.00		
Meredith	OC-b	03/04/14	Retrieve and review court filings - share with Meredith	0.20	25.20	126.00		
Meredith	OC-b	03/06/14	Review documents from Shawn	0.20	25.20	126.00		
Meredith	OC-e	03/06/14	Correspondence with Meredith	0.20	25.20	126.00		
Meredith	OC-b	03/17/14	Review recent filing - forward to Meredith	0.20	25.20	126.00		
Meredith	OC-e	03/26/14	Correspondence with Meredith RE hearing today	0.20	25.20	126.00		
Meredith	OC-b	03/26/14	Review documents filed today & forward to Meredith	0.20	25.20	126.00		
Meredith	OC-a	03/27/14	Correspondence from and call from Meredith RE contact [letter] from Adkins	0.30	37.80	126.00		
Meredith	OC-b	03/28/14	Review letter from Adkins to Meredith	0.20	25.20	126.00		
Meredith	OC-e	03/28/14	Correspondence with Shawn Morgan - letter included in correspondence	0.10	12.60	126.00		
Meredith	OC-b	03/28/14	Review recently filed amended order	0.10	12.60	126.00		
Meredith	OC-b	04/01/14	Review recent court filings	0.20	25.20	126.00		

198

Charles T. Berry, Esquire

Federal MEREDITH - YTD 2013 & 2014 - thru 08-18-2014

Printed 09/03/2014

Client Name	CODE	Date	Description	Hours	Rate	Period to Date	Period to Date	Period to Date
						FEES	EXPENSES	TOTAL
Meredith	OC-e	04/01/14	Correspondence with Meredith [send court filing, also]	0.20	25.20			
Meredith	OC-e	04/02/14	Review additional letter [Adkins to Meredith] and correspondence with Meredith	0.30	37.80			
Meredith	OC-b	04/04/14	Review order & forward to Meredith	0.20	25.20			
Meredith	OC-e	04/05/14	Correspondence from Meredith	0.10	12.60			
Meredith	OC-e	04/05/14	Correspondence from Meredith RE more letters from Chuck Adkins	0.10	12.60			
Meredith	OC-e	04/05/14	Review letters Adkins to Meredith	0.20	25.20			
Meredith	OC-a	04/23/14	Call from Meredith	0.90	113.40			
Meredith	OC-a	05/30/14	Call from and correspondence with Meredith	0.50	63.00			
Meredith	OC-a	06/17/14	Call from Meredith	0.20	25.20			
Meredith	OC-b	06/18/14	Retrieve and review court filings	0.30	37.80			
Meredith	OC-e	06/19/14	Correspondence with Meredith	0.20	25.20			
Meredith	OC-a	06/19/14	Call from Meredith	0.50	63.00			
Meredith	OC-a	06/24/14	Call from Meredith	0.30	37.80			
Meredith	OC-b	06/24/14	Review court filings and forward to Meredith	0.20	25.20			
Meredith	OC-e	06/30/14	Correspondence from and to Meredith RE sentencing and Adkins trial	0.30	37.80			
Meredith	OC-b	06/30/14	Retrieve and review court filings	0.20	25.20			
Meredith	OC-b	07/02/14	Retrieve, review and calendar court filing	0.10	12.60			
Meredith	OC-e	07/02/14	Correspondence with Meredith	0.20	25.20			
Meredith	OC-a	07/03/14	Calls to and from Shawn RE sentencing	0.30	37.80			
Meredith	OC-e	07/03/14	Correspondence with and call from Meredith	0.50	63.00			
Meredith	OC-e	07/07/14	Correspondence from and to Meredith	0.30	37.80			
Meredith	OC-e	07/11/14	Correspondence with Meredith & Morgan RE continuing sentencing	0.20	25.00			
Meredith	OC-e	07/14/14	Multiple correspondence from and to Meredith	0.30	37.80			
Meredith	OC-e	07/14/14	Multiple correspondence with Shawn RE joint motion	0.30	37.80			
Meredith	OC-c	07/14/14	Draft joint motion to continue sentencing and COS	0.90	113.40			
Meredith	OC-e	07/14/14	PDF motion and forward to Shawn for approval	0.10	12.60			
Meredith	OC-c	07/14/14	Amend joint motion	0.10	12.60			
Meredith	OC-e	07/14/14	PDF amended motion and file using CM/ECF	0.20	25.20			
Meredith	OC-e	07/14/14	Draft letter to Adkins to include joint motion	0.50	63.00			

263.60

Charles T. Berry, Esquire

Federal MEREDITH - YTD 2013 & 2014 - thru 08-18-2014

Printed 09/03/2014

Client Name	CODE	Date	Description	Hours	Rate	Period to Date	Period to Date	Period to Date
						FEES	EXPENSES	TOTAL
Meredith	OC-b	07/14/14	Retrieve and send numerous documents and recordings to Fremouw	0.70	87.50	125.00		
Meredith	OC-e	07/16/14	Correspondence with Meredith RE sentencing	0.20	25.20	126.00		
Meredith	OC-a	07/16/14	Call from Meredith	0.20	25.20	126.00		
Meredith	OC-b	07/17/14	Review court filings	0.20	25.20	126.00		
Meredith	OC-c	07/17/14	Draft waiver for Meredith and forward PDF of document to Meredith	0.50	63.00	126.00		
Meredith	OC-e	07/17/14	Correspondence with Shawn	0.20	25.20	126.00		
Meredith	OC-e	07/17/14	Multiple correspondence with Meredith	0.40	50.40	126.00		
Meredith	OC-b	07/28/14	Retrieve and review court documents	0.30	37.80	126.00		
Meredith	OC-b	07/30/14	Retrieve court filings	0.20	25.20	126.00		
Meredith	OC-e	07/30/14	Correspondence with Meredith	0.30	37.80	126.00		
Meredith	OC-b	07/31/14	Retrieve, review and calendar court documents	0.30	37.80	126.00		
Meredith	OC-e	07/31/14	Correspondence with Meredith RE Adkins' trial schedule	0.30	37.80	126.00		
Meredith	OC-a	07/31/14	Call from Meredith	0.40	50.40	126.00		
Meredith	OC-e	08/01/14	Correspondence with Shawn/Lisa RE subpoena for appearance at trial	0.20	25.20	126.00		
Meredith	OC-e	08/04/14	Correspondence with Lisa and Meredith RE trial subpoena and	0.20	25.20	126.00		
Meredith	OC-e	08/05/14	Correspondence with Government and Meredith RE trial testimony and potential plea	0.30	37.80	126.00		
Meredith	OC-b	08/06/14	Retrieve and review court filing	0.10	12.60	126.00		
Meredith	OC-e	08/06/14	Correspondence with Meredith	0.20	25.20	126.00		
Meredith	OC-e	08/07/14	Correspondence from Lisa RE Adkins' plea agreement	0.10	12.60	126.00		
Meredith	OC-e	08/07/14	Correspondence with Meredith RE plea hearing	0.10	12.60	126.00		
Meredith	OC-e	08/07/14	Correspondence from Meredith - included documents; correspondence with Shawn	0.20	25.20	126.00		
Meredith	OC-b	08/08/14	Retrieve and review court filings	0.30	37.80	126.00		
Meredith	OC-e	08/08/14	Correspondence with Meredith - forward filings	0.20	25.20	126.00		
Meredith	OC-e	08/11/14	Correspondence with clerk RE scheduling Meredith's sentencing	0.20	25.20	126.00		
Meredith	OC-e	08/11/14	Review correspondence and documents from Meredith & respond to the same	0.40	50.40	126.00		
Meredith	OC-a	08/12/14	Calls to and from Schoonover RE scheduling Meredith sentencing	0.20	25.20	126.00		
Meredith	OC-e	08/13/14	Correspondence with Musgrave RE address for Meredith	0.10	12.60	126.00		
Meredith	OC-a	08/13/14	Review correspondence from Meredith & call from Meredith	0.60	75.60	126.00		

50.40

Charles T. Berry, Esquire

Federal MEREDITH - YTD 2013 & 2014 - thru 08-18-2014

Printed 09/03/2014

Client Name	CODE	Date	Description	Hours	Rate	Period to Date		
						FEES	EXPENSES	TOTAL
Meredith	OC-b	08/13/14	Retrieve, review and calendar order	0.20	25.20			
Meredith	OC-e	08/14/14	Begin preparing documents to satisfy recent order	0.50	63.00			
Meredith	OC-e	08/14/14	Begin preparation for sentencing	2.00	252.00			
Meredith	OC-e	08/14/14	Correspondence with and call for Dyer RE SOR for Adkins	0.20	25.20			
Meredith	OC-e	08/18/14	Correspondence from Meredith - including numerous documents for review RE sentencing	1.30	163.80			
Meredith	OC-c	08/18/14	Continue research RE sentencing issues - enhanced sentences for obstruction	1.50	189.00			
Meredith	OC-e	08/18/14	Correspondence with CJA panel attorneys [all] RE enhancements under 2J1.2	0.20	25.20			
Fees 8/8/13 thru 8/18/14						11,621.90		
Meredith	OE	08/15/13	Photocopy charges	7.75				
Meredith	TE	08/15/13	Travel expenses - mileage	28.25				
Meredith	TE	08/15/13	Travel expenses - parking	0.50				
Meredith	OE	09/20/13	Photocopy charges	27.25				
Meredith	OE	09/20/13	Postage	6.15				
Meredith	TE	09/23/13	Travel expenses - mileage	28.25				
Meredith	TE	09/23/13	Travel expenses - parking	0.75				
Meredith	OE	02/05/14	Postage	12.35				
Meredith	OE	07/14/14	Photocopy charges	1.50				
Meredith	OE	07/14/14	Postage	0.49				
Expenses 8/8/13 thru 8/18/14							113.24	
Total Fees and Expenses 8/8/13 thru 8/18/14						28,621.90	465.28	29,087.18
						236.90	29,087.18	
						(0.00)		29,087.18

630.00